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8.2.43 Reveal Software 

The overall solution of Reveal Processing, Review, Analytics and NexLP AI 

Reveal’s fast and powerful processing engine allows you to securely digitize more than 
900 file types with our self-service uploader. Gain insights into your data, regardless 
of data size or complexity, faster than ever before. 

Reveal Review is the most comprehensive document review platform on the market 
with the flexibility and scale to manage any legal matter regardless of size and scope. 
With so many options available to accelerate and prioritise review, you need a review 
tool that seamlessly provides rich search, filtering, and document organisation features 
that enable you to efficiently manage the entire process from batching to production. 
In addition, Reveal is supported directly by its developers, so your support questions 
and feature requests will always have a direct line to the developers themselves. 

Reveal AI (formerly NexLP) harnesses artificial intelligence and machine learning 
technology to derive actionable insights. You can use established models from the AI 
Model Marketplace to quickly organise data or develop your organisation’s custom AI 
models to identify relevant information while isolating the noise. Reveal AI uncovers 
valuable connections and patterns buried deep within your data. 

Reveal’s Brainspace technology translates complex data into intuitive, easy-to 
understand interactive data visualisations, enabling your team to see patterns and 
relationships quickly. Seamlessly interact with large volumes of data that has been 
automatically organised using powerful unsupervised learning techniques. 

Electronic Discovery 

Don’t burn out your team wading through irrelevant data. Visualisation technologies 
like our Cluster Wheel and Story cards allow you to focus in on the most relevant 
information rapidly, while the Metadata Dashboard makes it easy to remove non-
relevant clusters and concentrate on relevant entities and timeframes 

Investigative Analytics 

Find out who knew what and when quickly with tools like interactive visualisations, 
concept search and Active Learning. For organizations that do lots of the same kind of 
investigations – like identifying sexual harassment or tracking negative social media 
sentiment – pre-trained models can accelerate the process of finding the answers you 
need. 

Early Case Assessment 

Use interactive data visualizations and machine learning technology to make more 
informed data decisions further upstream in the eDiscovery workflow. Quickly 
categorise, promote, or remove low value data with the industry’s most advanced AI. 
Quickly organise concepts, identify PII, and isolate junk email. Understand the facts of 
the legal matter earlier in the timeline so you can adjust your legal strategy to minimise 
costs and significantly reduce risk to your organisation. 

Intelligence Mining 

Analyse your organisation’s data lakes for actionable intelligence and valuable 
insights. Reveal finds things that would rather stay hidden, seeing through code names 
and other obfuscations to get right to the high value data faster than any other data 
analytics platform on the planet. 

Communication Compliance 

Reveal can empower your compliance team to quickly and efficiently analyse 
communication content for potential policy violations and legal risk. Our data 
visualizations, transparent concept search and machine learning technology can 
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expedite the identification of compliance issues while suppressing the communication 
noise. 

Global Footprint 

We understand that flexibility is key. Reveal is available to our clients in a SaaS 
environment, on-premises, or in a hybrid model, depending on your use case. 

For those spinning up instances around the globe, our SaaS instances are an ideal 
solution. We provide the ability to quickly and automatically offload data to secure, less 
expensive cloud storage, reducing your data storage hosting fees. 

Today, we can quickly spin up Reveal instances in 24 regions across six continents. 
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